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CASTLE HILL
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Castle Hill Location & Contact Details

By car 
Parking at Castle Mall is easy! With over 230 
undercover spaces, you can park for free for up to 3 
hours.

From Baulkham Hills/Parramatta 
Travel along Windsor Road to Baulkham Hills. Turn right 
from Windsor Road into Old Northern Road. Continue 
along until you reach Castle Hill and follow signs for 
parking.

From Pennant Hills 
Travel along Pennant Hills Road from the M2.Turn right 
into Old Castle Hill Road and then left into Old Northern 
Road. Continue onto Terminus Street and follow signs 
to parking.

From the City  
Travel northbound along the M2 and take exit 7. Turn 
right into Pennant Hills Road and left into Castle Hill 
Road. Turn left onto Old Northern Road, continue onto 
Terminus Street and follow signs to parking.

From Kellyville/Rouse Hill 
Travel along Windsor Road and turn right onto Old 
Northern Road and then left onto Terminus Street. 
Follow signs to parking.

By bus 
Castle Mall is serviced by Hillsbus routes 604, 606, 
608, 610, 618, 631, 632, 633, 634, 715 and 830. The 
Castle Mall bus stop is located on Old Castle Hill Road, 
outside David Jones at Castle Towers.

By taxi 
You can find a Premier Taxi on the taxi stand located 
outside the upper level entrance to David Jones on 
Castle Hill Road.


